
Thursday, September 14, 2023 

Announcements 

Hello Sierra Vista High School Students!  In our efforts to 
maximize the instructional time of our students, deliveries 
or drop offs of any type are NOT allowed.  In addition, 
food deliveries to the campus for students are 
PROHIBITED.  Any item (food, materials, etc.) requesting 
to be dropped off by a parent/guardian or delivery by any 
restaurant or affiliate (Door Dash, Uber Eats, Grub Hub, 
etc.) will NOT be accepted by the staff of Sierra Vista High 
School.  Please make sure you have all of your school/
athletic items/materials needed for the school day before 
leaving the house.  Thank you for your support. 
 
Attention Seniors with a Home Lunch Pass:  If you do not 
have an I.D. with your Home Lunch Pass on it, you can 
now get your I.D. in the A.S.B. Office.  As a reminder, you 
need to turn in your Yellow or Blue card when you take 
your picture.  You will have until Friday, September 15th, 
to get your I.D.  As of Monday, September 18th, you will no 
longer be allowed to leave campus at lunch with your 
Yellow or Blue card.  Make sure that you get your I.D.! 
 
Calling All High School Students Ages 14-17:  Metro’s 
Youth Council presents the Metro Youth Summit, an event 
by youth for youth!  This year’s theme is Traveling 
Sustainably.  Be part of the conversation on how you can 
explore L.A.’s best destinations while lowering your carbon 
footprint. 
    Date:  Saturday, September 23rd 
    Time:  9:30am 
    Location:  Union Station Ticketing Concourse Room 
Go to your Counselor’s Google Classroom or the 
Counseling Department’s Grade Level Google Classroom 
to get more information on this event and to find the link to 
register. 
 
Join us at the 10th Annual Latino College Expo at Cal Poly 
Pomona.  The Access and Transition Department would 
like to invite you to the 10th Annual Latino College Expo 
held at Cal Poly Pomona.  This event will feature over 70 
colleges, seminars and a resource fair.  The event will take 
place on Saturday, September 16th, at 10:00am .  We are 
looking forward to meeting each and every one of you and 
learning together.  See link to register on the School Wide 
Google Classroom. 

Frosh Football vs Valley Christian 
  @ Valley Christian - 4:00 
 
Girls JV Tennis vs Don Lugo 
  @ Sierra Vista - 2:15 
 
 
 
 
Girls Varsity Tennis vs Don Lugo 
  @ Don Lugo - 3:30 
 
Boys Varsity Water Polo vs Alhambra 
  @ Granda Pool Park - 3:30 

Sports 

Seniors:  If you have continued trying to make an 
appointment for your senior portraits and have not been 
able to, you’re in luck.  New appointment dates have just 
opened for October 4th and 5th.  Please book them as soon 
as possible so you can ensure your spot in the yearbook.  
Unfortunately, any student who does not take their senior 
portrait will NOT appear in the yearbook, so head online 
and book your appointment now.  You can find 
instructions on the svdons.com yearbook website. 

Clubs & Activities 

Yearbook 

Do you like to dance?  TODAY is the LAST day of tryouts 
for Dance Phantom from 3:30-4:30 outside of Room 304.  
See Mrs. Durfee if you have any questions. 
 
Attention Dual Language Program Students:  Dual  
Language Club will have a meeting TODAY at Lunch in 
Room 505, Ms. Torres classroom.  Come hear about our 
upcoming activities and how you can help and earn  
community service hours!  Hope to see you there! 



Faculty Section 

 

 

Please Release The Following 

Frosh Football 

@ 1:00 

ALL Girls Tennis 

@ 1:00 

Boys Varsity Water Polo 

@ 1:00 
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